
Ayushi Dubal is selected as a scholarship 
recipient of Google's 2020 APAC Women 
Techmakers Scholars Program. Through the 
Women Techmakers Scholars Program, 
Google is furthering Dr. Anita Borg’s vision 
of creating gender equality in the tech 
industry by encouraging women to excel as 
active participants and leaders in the field. 
The scholarship is awarded based on 
academic performance, leadership, and 
impact on the community of women in tech. 
She cleared three rounds of selection- a 
written essay round, the Google Online 
Challenge, and a telephonic interview, to be 
selected as one of 74 scholars from all 
across India and Greater China. She was 
awarded a cash scholarship of 1000 USD 
and was invited to a virtual retreat organized 
for the scholars, which had multiple 
workshops and sessions that boosted 
personal and professional growth. 


